0

s

@@%33&\ TFLIDCITDTD

&=
N
3 8
Q 0
Te @
o~
C
P m
w O
c @
w @
B2
B x
W m
»n £
)
6) .-
aa
8.z
473
2 O
B s
—
O o
jfl\
o]
mda
o™
T
.m |
(- 4
3 <
=
a .
C o~
R o |
RS
B g
B2
5
=
8
,WM
;ﬁlu.
& 5
B £
Q
m
% 18
m1_
[}
£
B35
>

N &

c@ﬁ@ﬁ@ﬁ

i

53]

-

Il
.

DT 8O3 YRE3n

27-02-2020.

OB

RTETD
o O

(BT T R)

83*

@0

EwnTe)

=
o

bz

kodok ok

!

(GaR)



(o1l BuerLid 0y EE, T, 0.2, @ede , 9090 PARI

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board
NOTIFICATION

No.BWSSB/C/CAO-S/5199/2019-20, Bangalore dated 06.03.2020
Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water Harvesting) (Amendment) Regulations, 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 72A and 88 of the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 36 of 1964)

with previous approval of the State Government vide Order No. UDD 10 MNI 2019 dated: 27.12.2019 the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage
board hereby makes the following regulations further to amend the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water harvesting) Regulations, 2010,
the draft of the said Regulations is previously published as required by sub-section (2) of Section 88 of Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Act,
1964 vide Notification No: No.BWSSB/C/CAO-5/4058/2019-20, Bangalore dated: 18.01.2020 in Part 1l of Karnataka Gazette dated: 50.01.2020
namely:-
Title and Commencement:- (1) These regulations may be called the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water Harvesting)
{Amendment) Regulations, 2019.
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.
1. Amendment of regulation 8:- In regulation 8 of the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water harvesting) Regulations, 2010.
(1) in sub-regulation (1),-
(a) for the words "twenty five percent", the words "fifty percent" shall be substituted; and
(b) for the words "fifty percent", the words "hundred percent" shall be substituted.
(i) in sub-regulation (2).-
(a) for the words "fifty percent”, the words "hundred percent"” shall be substituted: and
(b) for the words "hundred percent", the words "two hundred percent” shall be substituted.

By order,

Chief Administrative Officer cum Secretary
Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board

PD-07



N A BRUFIB O I3, HhdRT, 0.2, BT, 9090 oleF:]

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board

NOTIFICATION

No.BWSSB/C/CAO-S/ 5200 /2019-20, Bangalore dated 06.03.2020
Bangalore Water Supply (Amendment) Regulations, 2019
In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 61 and 88 of the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Act. 1964
(Karnataka Act 36 of 1964) with previous approval of the State Government vide Order No. UDD 10 MNI 2019 dated:
27.12.2019 the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage board hereby makes the following regulations further to amend the
Bangalore Water Supply Regulations. 1963, the draft of the said Regulations is previously published as required by sub-section
(2) of Section 88 of Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Act. 1964 vide Notification No: No. BWSSB/C/CAO-S/4058/2019-
20. Bangalore dated: 18.01.2020 in Part [1] of Karnataka Gazette dated: 30.01.2020 namely:-
Title and Commencement:- (] ) These regulations may he called the Bangalore Water Supply (Amendment) Regulations.
2019.
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.
. Amendment of regulation 5.3:- In the Bangalore Water Supply Regulations,1965. in regulation 5.3, in the table for serial
number-1 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted. namely:-

RE ' Residential Building ' Rs.400/- per sq.mtrs. |
| | |
i | |

By order.

Chief Administrative Officer cum Secretary
Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board

PD-08



