
{- rwd @
ecQtgaon gdE..3Berod)d)

dodu".)nSt
Volume-155

dodd.oo
lssue - 11It

Io.ld.: dzia 24 ,iitc 2020

^:- "atJ 9l I e.

irordd crcdro qerosJ?fg *o$;{d dcd> deecd: €QE"ode?t
ioeJcQ xd elQi"oa3drl9;

l=':c-r rl ?=:ei

er6n,odd
adcb: i,6i cad =i":ECtJ 1i,r=s>:".1

J:9:oir: ai(" r.,19: i ?i. -JJ.JJ ;J-Ji;! a,rl,r\

d.c-d

dqc$.!.{ 6;JDcd 10.01.2020 dgqod gc$Doi nddJoooRdrd

o.)et Y;0 ;lo:..'Ju - 5c,Jrr,i, u),.
,.trir d-qr.

a3cdd'nd:. a.]Dat 27-02-2a20

i6io$d ddlodot-+ (dof(Jcf"er) ;dc.Jd oDsldod drdoc
erd>a:od-O erig:isDRd.

((J3,4)

i



3i').iJd o,?iJidt,.bd.r,d, oJ, drDal'F , 9o9o

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board
NOTI FICATION

No.BWSSB/C/CAO-S/ 5199 /201 9-20, Bangalore dated 06.03.2020

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water Harvesting) (Amendment) Regulations, 2019

In exercise ofthe powers conferred by section 72A and 88 ofthe Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Acl, 1964 (Karnataka Act 36 of 1964)

with previous approvai of the State Government vide Order No. UDD l0 MNI 20I 9 daled: 27 .12.2019 the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage

boar.d hereby makes the following regulations further to amend the Bangalore Water Suppiy and Sewerage (Rain Water harvesting) Regulations, 20 10,

the draft ofthe said Regulations is previously published as required by sttb-section (2) ofSection 88 ofBangalore Water Supp)y and Sewerage Act.

!964 vide ^\orificarion No: No. BW SS B/C/CAO-S/4058/20l9-20, Bangalore dated: 18.01.2020 in Part III of Karnataka Gazette dated: 30.01.2020

namely:-

Title and Comm€ncement:- ( l) These regulations may be called the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water Harvesting)

(Amendment) Regulations, 201 9.

(2) They shall come into tbrce from the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.

l. Amendment ofregulation 8:- In regulation 8 ofthe Bangalore Water Supp)y and Sewerage (Raio Water harvestirrg) Regulalions.2010.

(i) in sub-regulation ( l),-

(a) for the words "twenty Uve percent". the words "fil1y percent" shall be substituted; and

(b) for the words "fifty percent", the words "hundred percent" sllall be substituted

(ii) in sub-regulation (2),-

(a) for the words "fifly percent", the words "hundred pe:'cent" shall be substituted: and

(b) for the words "hundred percent", the words "two hundred percent" shallbe substituted.

By order.

Chief Adminislrative Ofllcer cunr Secretary

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board

PD-07



ddrFcjd o&adidr,rbdd.d, .)9. dlJ?rf ,JC9O

ore Water Supply and Sewerage Board

CJfJN

Bangal

N()TI FICAT loN

No. BWSS B/C/CAO-S/ 5200 /2019_20, Bangatore dared 06.0J.2020

rn exercise or rhe porvers *,F#I"J1::::Hou,l ffi;'i1? H::lx::.'il::"1"*rry and Sewerage Acr re64{Kamataka Act 16 of Is6a.l ,"ith p;"r;;;' ;o;;;;;i'"r'rhe srare cnr.rnr.ni-r-;a. order \o. uDD r0 Nrxi zors dared:27 '12:019 the Banga)ore water SuppJy 
-ana 

's'.*.rug. 
toard hereby ,rrur,..-ii" tirrro*ing regulations lurther to amend rheBangalore water Supp)y Regulations. it;L5. the draft o? rr," *ia n.gr]uti.,.,.-;, pr."-*ry published as required by sub-section(2) of Section 88 of Banualore lMater Sr'rpplv. ana s"*.jrug" ncr. l9o+ vide -r..-oriilcation \o: r-o. BWSSB/c/uAo -itcosstzotg-20' Bangalore dated: I8.dr .2[r:u in parr lii ot rurnaiata dur",,. ,lo,.d, 30.0 r .2020 namery:-

,0,r. '"'" 
and Commencement:- (l) Thcse regulations nray he called the tsangalore water Supply (Amendnrent) Regulations.

(2) They shall come into fbrce from tlrc dale of their lincl puhlication in rhe olrcial Gazette.l Amendment of regulation 5.3:- In thc Bangalore waref Supply Regulations. )t)65. in regulation 5.3, in the table tbr serial.unrber-r and trre enlries rerating therel0, the rb orving shalr be substituted. nanrery:-

Residcntial Building I{s..100/- per scl.mlrs

[-]y order'.

Chief Ad ninistrative OIficer cum Secretarv
Bangrrlure Water Supply anr! Sewerage BoardPD.O8

l


