GU«&&NUD m.mmwunudﬂuuﬂuu

RoRYL-ORR BerERts, MICHm0, mERO ,20, J090 ( [RFP OO, IIIIF 0FY0) | Zoud-on
Volume-155 I Bengaluru, THURSDAY, JANUARY , 30, 2020 ( Magha 10, ShakaVarsha 1941) M Issue - 05
N &
TRFOR GOl AeRNY SwIT T FEA® TRTONYR

TOWODAT WPRBAWRNE

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board
NOTIFICATION-II

No.BWSSB/C/CAO-S/4058/2019-20, Bangalore dated :08.01.2020

The draft of the following regulations further to amend the Bangalore Water Supply Regulations, 1965, which the Bangalore Water Supply and
Sewerage Board proposes to make in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 61 and 88 of the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Act, 1964
(Karnataka Act 36 of 1964) with previous approval of the State Government is hereby published as required by sub-section (2) of section 88 of the said
Act, for the information of all persons likely to be affected thereby and notice is hereby given that the said draft will be taken into consideration after

thirty days from the date of its publication in the official gazette.

Any objection or suggestion which may be received by the Board from any person with respect to the said draft before the expiry of the period
specified above will be considered by the Board. Objections and suggestions may be addressed to the Chairman, the Bangalore Water Supply and
Sewerage Board, Bengaluru-560009.

(OCe)



Of0 BT DRI, HHLIT, A0 &3ITD, 90,90 N &

DRAFT REGULATIONS
1. Title and Commencement:- (1) These regulations may he called the Bangalore Water Supply (Amendment) Regulations, 2019.

(2) They shall come into force from the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Amendment of regulation 5.3:- In the Bangalore Water Supply Regulations, 1965, in regulation 5.3, in the table for serial number-1 and the
entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, :ma_&vx-

| 1. | Residential Building | Rs.400/- per sq.mtrs. |

By order,

Chief Administrative Officer cum Secretary
Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board
PD-01

Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board

NOTIFICATION

Ze.wsmmw\O\O\rO-chmm\Nc~o-NP Bangalore dated:08.01.2020

The draft of the following regulations further to amend the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water Harvesting) Regulations, 2010,
which the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board proposes to make in exercise of the powers conferred by section 72A and 88 of the Bangalore



>R & BT BT, Moo, K0, as3a30, s0s0

DRAFT REGULATIONS

1. Title and Commencement:- (1) These regulations may be called the Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage (Rain Water Harvesting)

(Amendment) Regulations, 2019.
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment of regulation §:-
(1) in sub-regulation (1),-

(a) for the words "twenty five percent”, the words "fifty percent” shall be substituted: and
(b) for the words "fifty percent", the words "hundred percent" shal] be substituted.

(1) in sub-regulation (2),-
(a) for the words "fifty percent", the words "hundred percent" shall be substituted: and
(b) for the words "hundred percent”, the words "two hundred percent" shall be substituted.
By order,
Chief Administrative Officer cum Secretary
Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board
PD-02
FRTRE TROE SEZony
S0t W NTOFTE SWIONYD

DHCL:-  PREEZ  Besad VT FoTT udmaaoucmux TPOTBOZ  FeSoD

8.20.0.0%". SRIROTO Berd-2 F00BY DOTRRLDT 503 — @de3.

LT3N - ) ZTRFog sdes ao&u”uGﬂ 258 @208 1994, B003 9.12.1998.

2) IFOS 3863 \.ao&mraGﬂ 34 2208 2005, BJ00F 29.7.2005.
3) ATersIR, PovdEes ABeFIT|EOD, =T Esfcraty 7023:9009:850::80/

300X /201415, QI0% 24.09.2019, 18.10.2019 B 22.11.2019.



S0 IVOFEIT Sﬁu&m‘ TOTOTT, A0 %ITO , 9090 N &

¥ Soajgrefoaedho/Resw-so/rb-07/512/2017-18
BT00T: 27.03.2018.

3 ao&% &oﬂoﬁao\mmm\&woa\ ¥4/ 6052/ 2017-18
Bde0T: 05.03.2018.

4. Bw0s: 23.03.2018 Jordd BB @oBdy  Tedad
Qe ad.

3. ao&%&owgo\&caglg\aluuoimmou\moilgm
B™00T: 27.03.2018.

6. ao&% B9y 151 QODXTD 2018 HT0S: 12.11.2019.

7. 30 ehHTBe3S =33 ao&&n Joxaho/a0esen—
59/TH-07/ 3458/2019-20 HBT0B: 26.11.2019.

8. 30@ wHIJRSS soorwd Coeg TRy Fzwrdoded
BT00T: 05.12.2019.

ok sk ok ok
8e 0. Do, WoBI 25008 BO. QIE RS, 29¢3 ao&% 6588 Tws-17. &wm& Qggerl, donded BoxdoInT Tedr3 aom. ERSLP
2Jorigedd &Cmvo&mgn 23T &owi QeveIrlevnad o035 tvgdea (4)3 HoBwodh whReerdBodeodn BJo0T: 27.03.2018
S0 IB0e0B R eedS Boed o3 280e5eAR). ©8303 e0@3ea)(6)38 IFoe B8 wRRRBN TBodreToAS.
EODDBEWD. Je @0. Do, TeBN 25008 Bo. JWEES, VoAt BHoIHI 01 ToP. FWORY, Boridedy 2ozHoBrade
23T mvﬁl Qeedrieeoa 2O eveded (7)08 s3> @O.dammao&auz BRIBY, 83033 IEH GO&E&&Q&&W BTo0T: 05.12.20190
T EIT Doz BIBY BBLITN FO@D wHRRIIN To2odsBod o) wende esgemrdrish 98¢ BIe3STadn Ooay B3R TBe3on

~ o U

BTJooEdOB 30 BINE  28rh DPYWBO3  RVeBJNDIB. ©E8 0D wdIeEIoh 283 cdreld)de esZesrBrith
ez BrieodhyBdee.



-

i & FmRFLE Uk, CiTRT, A0, BRSO, 9090 o8¢

Roneedd INcRTH TePTT
eOTRFRRDS, ¥BReEINT o, Iontwedd 575006
BRUwmeeT: memmmmgcumgu"thwmmm_mﬂngﬂu.hw" 2459545

« 1

I/ HSDERY/ 06 | 2016-17 30-01-2020

ge32.&. %O 17(3) OFeL eRTT SHFTT e Fonsedd INCRTH TRTTT TTERBOR J[BedRom wiR, VowIUeF T %.80. 6/1,

.
6/2, 6/3, 6/4, 6/5 6/60, 6/11, 6/13, 6/13V, 6/13%, 6/14 TZ 5/4 TYI 17 DB 49 ForF WNAIY RETOF) [T AVEBINDE,

DEIBBODRY, AFIOIHEEY, IEO WART, F3.2.0. oY 800 35 T0F BT TPOTCE e TH B, DSEROT OROOR IeTwen HveBTEN

POPDATOZR. 85 03ReIIN INTRTH Qeesdod BY Ro: S92 /305/0Lw3/2017 &»0E 13-09-2017 002 o83 H1DIRTI NRDIT.

30308
TONERT> INTIPZ)Q TR0
ROONERTO
PD-03
e3orisedd edd VoTa D) 2,¢e3308 HOBY
No : BWSSB/CHAD/20-2016/EST-07/4249 //2019-20, Date::20.01.2020

0T e3I
dRaD: e 0. ToRw, woHI 2T TO. JWEDT, Jonwvedd
DoBoIM3 Todr’ aom Baqauz Borided sowhorByodey
20T &umml DevseJriowTe o8 @Du&m&ao&mﬁp
TOOE 3T 98&&@&% DTS Eﬂ
gogdead: | 88&& ao&&” S0/ 11442/T-1/2018 BT00T:

o

24.02.2018.



G

Pn &

e e RS T
BTeFis Dok T, Mol

T

S, 20, B8R0, 2090 20

esg38ow3, Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board (Absorption of Driver appointed on deputation basis in Bangalore Water
Supply and Sewerage Board) (Amendment) Regulations-2010 3 e=bTod Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board (Absorption of

Driver appointed on deputation basis in Bangalore Water Supply and Sewerage Board) Regulations-2008393 B¢ 3¢Ns RO DB
QoEIiggod e ©o. Tomw, DB BT FO. Qwoe®dd, Bonvedd DHSM3 Tedr ao%, PO, Jorited aoEoBdyade 23T

BZ} dwedriewIen demroe dTUNIIW.

1. S°=3D &8&@ Jeealodhe BROODT DodT 50T FO. JWVOEDT &uﬂo& VDTom00I30ToH DoByad 23500F &uwi

QeseTriRyoe.

2. 33D DoBdwod Jedr! Deverieod Egdodey FSeeE P00 RBoRBRORB BT0THOB BOIER HBOFZodR, ANOWATe.

3. P36} DoBdwabe eeed BPod WeldI Bed de. 27750-650-29050-780-36850-1160-48450-1600-62850-
1960-84410-2500-869100% 30§ =e33F Be3TS=, ATDTAIE BOB.

4. I50e3x8 e363e3 Soad: DPB(JRWe®) 04 Py 2005 BOITOT:

o&wm@ao&&uz @woauau& Z003.

PD-04

5053y 1 BEF 104 [UWLE 2019

FoOFL3® XTOFO

Wenwneos, OT2c8:21.01.2020.

== AN D =L AT o mem AN Ao T
~= P

PRSNGSRS VIS DERC ouOocnu.«v(er

OZRB]

31.03.2006 8 obrleyzenNdE JeIF 0238

edoritbed Qedd VT DA a¥e3008 ory,
Foa3ed =, 3orEedh-560009

Pt 12 e~ om—— Tal——rsrA—a

STWT ATST U AW T vy

g e

WTSA AT,

TONEB0 [ 00T DTecT:18.07.2019T0T BRORAT



